ATTACHMENT C - Pricing Forms

Please See Section 2.09 Price Sheet information
for Instructions on filling out this attachment

EMBARQ Florida, Inc.

Company Representative: Tom Gallogly

Representative Email: tom.gallogly@embarg.com

Company Mailing Address: 8406-G Benjamin Road

City: Tampa State: FL ZIP Code: 33634
Telephone #: 813-494-6004

24-Hour Emergency Telephone #: 813-494-6004

FAX #: 813-880-7639

Representative Signature:(required)
Printed Name and Title: Thomas J. McEvoy, President - EMBARQ Business Markets
GEOGRAPHICAL BIDDING LOCATION: Southern Region

Price for Copper Runs

# Item Price

1 JRun of 25-Pair Category 5e Plenum $ $6.83 ft.
2 JRun of 25-Pair Category 5e Non-Plenum $ $3.92 ft.
3 JRun of (2) 25-Pair Category 5e Plenum $ $11.96 ft.
4 |Run of (2) 25-Pair Category 5e Non-Plenum $ $6.12 ft.
5 |Run of (4) 25-Pair Category 5e Plenum $ $21.84 ft.
6 [Run of (4) 25-Pair Category 5e Non-Plenum $ $10.92 ft.
7 |Run of (8) 25-Pair Category 5e Plenum $ $42.36 ft.
8 [Run of (8) 25-Pair Category 5e Non-Plenum $ $19.00 ft.
9 |Run of 4-Pair Category 5e Plenum $ $2.04 ft.
10 JRun of 4-Pair Category 5e Non-Plenum $ $1.90 ft.
11 JRun of 4-Pair Category 5e Outside Plant Filled Cable $ $1.05 ft.
12 JRun of 4-Pair Category 3 Plenum $ $1.84 ft.
13 JRun of 4-Pair Category 3 Non-Plenum $ $1.82 ft.
14 JRun of 4-Pair Category 3 Outside Plant Filled Cable $ $1.02 ft.
15 JRun of 6-Pair Category 3 Plenum $ $2.23 ft.
16 JRun of 6-Pair Category 3 Non-Plenum $ $2.18 ft.
17 JRun of 6-Pair Category 3 Outside Plant Filled Cable $ $0.88 ft.
18 JRun of 12-Pair Category 3 Plenum $ $2.54 ft.
19 JRun of 12-Pair Category 3 Non-Plenum $ $2.48 ft.
20 JRun of 25-Pair Category 3 Plenum $ $3.54 ft.
21 |Run of 25-Pair Category 3 Non-Plenum $ $3.12 ft.
22 JRun of 25-Pair Category 3 Outside Plant Filled Cable $ $1.83 ft.
23 |Run of 50-Pair Category 3 Plenum $ $4.84 ft.
24 JRun of 50-Pair Category 3 Non-Plenum $ $4.05 ft.
25 JRun of 50-Pair Category 3 Outside Plant Filled Cable $ $2.68 ft.
26 |Run of 100-Pair Category 3 Plenum $ $7.78 ft.
27 |Run of 100-Pair Category 3 Non-Plenum $ $6.08 ft.
28 [Run of 100-Pair Category 3 Outside Plant Filled Cable $ $5.77 ft.
29 |Run of 200-Pair Category 3 Plenum $ $12.85 ft.
30 JRun of 200-Pair Category 3 Non-Plenum $ $10.25 ft.
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31 JRun of 200-Pair Category 3 Outside Plant Filled Cable $ $8.05 ft.
32 [Run of 400-Pair Category 3 Plenum $ $23.99 ft.
33 |Run of 400-Pair Category 3 Non-Plenum $ $18.00 ft.
34 |Run of 400-Pair Category 3 Outside Plant Filled Cable $ $14.96 ft.
35 [Run of 800-Pair Category 3 Plenum $ $46.63 ft.
36 JRun of 800-Pair Category 3 Non-Plenum $ $34.65 ft.
37 |Run of 800-Pair Category 3 Outside Plant Filled Cable $ $29.90 ft.
Includes installation, termination and testing per the specifications. Includes cable
fire stopping and cable support hangers and electronic documentation.
Price for (1-10) Single Drop Outlets
# Item Price
38 |Four-Pair Category 5e Drop UTP Plenum $ $184.22 ea.
39 [|Four-Pair Category 5e Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $119.56 ea.
40 |Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Plenum $ $222.04 ea.
41 |Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $139.08 ea.
Includes installation, termination, testing and certification per the specifications. Includes cable,
jack, outlet plate, wire management, support hooks, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where
required and electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (11-25) Single Drop Outlets
# Item Price
42 |Four-Pair Category 5e Drop UTP Plenum $ $178.12 ea.
43 |Four-Pair Category 5e Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $117.12 ea.
44 |Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Plenum $ $214.72 ea.
45 |Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $136.64 ea.
Includes installation, termination, testing and certification per the specifications. Includes cable,
jack, outlet plate, wire management, support hooks, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where
required and electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (26-100) Single Drop Outlets
# Item Price
46 |Four-Pair Category 5e Drop UTP Plenum $ $164.70 ea.
47 |Four-Pair Category 5e Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $112.24 ea.
48 |Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Plenum $ $201.30 ea.
49 |Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $131.76 ea.
Includes installation, termination, testing and certification per the specifications. Includes cable,
jack, outlet plate, wire management, support hooks, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where
required and electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (101-500) Single Drop Outlets
# Item Price
50 |Four-Pair Category 5e Drop UTP Plenum $ $151.28 ea.
51 |Four-Pair Category 5e Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $107.36 ea.
52 |Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Plenum $ $187.88 ea.
53 |Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $126.88 ea.

Includes installation, termination, testing and certification per the specifications. Includes cable,
jack, outlet plate, wire management, support hooks, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where
required and electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.

| Price for (Over 500) Single Drop Outlets
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# Item Price
54 |Four-Pair Category 5e Drop UTP Plenum $ $137.86 ea.
55 |Four-Pair Category 5e Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $104.92 ea.
56 [Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Plenum $ $174.46 ea.
57 |Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $124.44 ea.
Includes installation, termination, testing and certification per the specifications. Includes cable,
jack, outlet plate, wire management, support hooks, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where
required and electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (1-10) Multiple Drop Outlets
# Item Price
58 |Two Four-Pair Category 5e Drops UTP Plenum $ $283.04 ea.
59 |Two Four-Pair Category 5e Drops UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $180.56 ea.
60 |Two Four-Pair Category 6 Drops UTP Plenum $ $356.24 ea.
61 |Two Four-Pair Category 6 Drops UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $219.60 ea.
62 |One Four-Pair Category 5e and One Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Plenum $ $320.86 ea.
63 |One Four-Pair Category 5e and One Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $200.08 ea.
Includes installation, termination, testing and certification per the specifications. Includes cable,
jack, outlet plate, wire management, support hooks, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where
required and electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (11-25) Multiple Drop Outlets
# Item Price
64 |Two Four-Pair Category 5e Drops UTP Plenum $ $276.94 ea.
65 |Two Four-Pair Category 5e Drops UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $178.12 ea.
66 |Two Four-Pair Category 6 Drops UTP Plenum $ $350.14 ea.
67 |Two Four-Pair Category 6 Drops UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $217.16 ea.
68 |One Four-Pair Category 5e and One Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Plenum $ $314.76 ea.
69 |One Four-Pair Category 5e and One Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $197.64 ea.
Includes installation, termination, testing and certification per the specifications. Includes cable,
jack, outlet plate, wire management, support hooks, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where
required and electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (26-50) Multiple Drop Outlets
# Item Price
70 |Two Four-Pair Category 5e Drops UTP Plenum $ $270.84 ea.
71 |Two Four-Pair Category 5e Drops UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $175.68 ea.
72 |Two Four-Pair Category 6 Drops UTP Plenum $ $344.04 ea.
73 |Two Four-Pair Category 6 Drops UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $214.72 ea.
74 |One Four-Pair Category 5e and One Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Plenum $ $308.66 ea.
75 |One Four-Pair Category 5e and One Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $195.20 ea.
Includes installation, termination, testing and certification per the specifications. Includes cable,
jack, outlet plate, wire management, support hooks, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where
required and electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (51-100) Multiple Drop Outlets
# Item Price
76 |Two Four-Pair Category 5e Drops UTP Plenum $ $263.52 ea.
77 |Two Four-Pair Category 5e Drops UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $173.24 ea.
78 |Two Four-Pair Category 6 Drops UTP Plenum $ $336.72 ea.
79 |Two Four-Pair Category 6 Drops UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $212.28 ea.
80 |One Four-Pair Category 5e and One Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Plenum $ $301.34 ea.
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81 |One Four-Pair Category 5e and One Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) | $ $192.76 ea.
Includes installation, termination, testing and certification per the specifications. Includes cable,
jack, outlet plate, wire management, support hooks, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where
required and electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (101-500) Multiple Drop Outlets
# Item Price
82 |Two Four-Pair Category 5e Drops UTP Plenum $ $250.10 ea.
83 |Two Four-Pair Category 5e Drops UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $170.80 ea.
84 |Two Four-Pair Category 6 Drops UTP Plenum $ $323.30 ea.
85 |Two Four-Pair Category 6 Drops UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $209.84 ea.
86 |One Four-Pair Category 5e and One Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Plenum $ $287.92 ea.
87 |One Four-Pair Category 5e and One Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $190.32 ea.
Includes installation, termination, testing and certification per the specifications. Includes cable,
jack, outlet plate, wire management, support hooks, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where
required and electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (Over 500) Multiple Drop Outlets
# Item Price
88 |Two Four-Pair Category 5e Drops UTP Plenum $ $237.90 ea.
89 |Two Four-Pair Category 5e Drops UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $168.36 ea.
90 |Two Four-Pair Category 6 Drops UTP Plenum $ $298.90 ea.
91 |Two Four-Pair Category 6 Drops UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $207.40 ea.
92 |One Four-Pair Category 5e and One Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Plenum $ $275.72 ea.
93 |One Four-Pair Category 5e and One Four-Pair Category 6 Drop UTP Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $187.88 ea.
Includes installation, termination, testing and certification per the specifications. Includes cable,
jack, outlet plate, wire management, support hooks, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where
required and electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (1-10) Fiber Optic Cable to the Workstation
# Item Price
94 |Two strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $236.68 ea.
95 |Two strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $172.02 ea.
96 |Four strands Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $308.66 ea.
97 |Four strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $246.44 ea.
Includes installation, termination and testing per the specifications. Includes cable, ST or SC connectors,
outlet, panel, wire management, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where required and
electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (11-25) Fiber Optic Cable to the Workstation
# Item Price
98 |Two strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $230.58 ea.
99 |Two strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $169.58 ea.
100 |Four strands Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $302.56 ea.
101 |Four strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $244.00 ea.
Includes installation, termination and testing per the specifications. Includes cable, ST or SC connectors,
outlet, panel, wire management, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where required and
electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (26-50) Fiber Optic Cable to the Workstation
# Item Price
102 | Two strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $224.48 ea.
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103 | Two strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $167.14 ea.
104 |Four strands Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $296.46 ea.
105 |Four strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $241.56 ea.
Includes installation, termination and testing per the specifications. Includes cable, ST or SC connectors,
outlet, panel, wire management, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where required and
electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (51-100) Fiber Optic Cable to the Workstation
# Item Price
106 | Two strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $217.16 ea.
107 | Two strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $164.70 ea.
108 |Four strands Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $289.14 ea.
109 |Four strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $239.12 ea.
Includes installation, termination and testing per the specifications. Includes cable, ST or SC connectors,
outlet, panel, wire management, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where required and
electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (101-500) Fiber Optic Cable to the Workstation
# Item Price
110 | Two strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $211.06 ea.
111 | Two strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $162.26 ea.
112 |Four strands Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $283.04 ea.
113 JFour strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $236.68 ea.
Includes installation, termination and testing per the specifications. Includes cable, ST or SC connectors,
outlet, panel, wire management, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where required and
electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (Over 500) Fiber Optic Cable to the Workstation
# Item Price
114 | Two strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $204.96 ea.
115 | Two strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $159.82 ea.
116 |Four strands Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $276.94 ea.
117 |Four strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum (In Conduit) $ $234.24 ea.
Includes installation, termination and testing per the specifications. Includes cable, ST or SC connectors,
outlet, panel, wire management, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where required and
electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (1-50) Coaxial Cable to the Outlet
# Item Price
118 JOne RG-6 Coaxial Cable Plenum $ $217.16 ea.
119 |One RG-6u Coaxial Cable Plenum $ $224.48 ea.
120 |One RG-11 Coaxial Cable Plenum $ $547.78 ea.
121 |One RG-59 Coaxial Cable Plenum $ $201.30 ea.
Includes installation, termination and testing per the specifications. Includes cable, F connectors,
outlet plate, panel cabinet, wire management, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where required and
electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (51-100) Coaxial Cable to the Outlet
# Item Price
122 |One RG-6 Coaxial Cable Plenum $ $197.64 ea.
123 |One RG-6u Coaxial Cable Plenum $ $204.96 ea.
124 1One RG-11 Coaxial Cable Plenum $ $528.26 ea.
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125 |One RG-59 Coaxial Cable Plenum I $ $181.78 ea.
Includes installation, termination and testing per the specifications. Includes cable, F connectors,
outlet plate, panel cabinet, wire management, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where required and
electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for (Over 100) Coaxial Cable to the Outlet
# Item Price
126 |One RG-6 Coaxial Cable Plenum $ $191.54 ea.
127 |One RG-6u Coaxial Cable Plenum $ $198.86 ea.
128 |One RG-11 Coaxial Cable Plenum $ $522.16 ea.
129 |One RG-59 Coaxial Cable Plenum $ $176.90 ea.
Includes installation, termination and testing per the specifications. Includes cable, F connectors,
outlet plate, panel cabinet, wire management, fire stopping, Cat 5 cable hangers where required and
electronic documentation. The link length can range from 20 to 295 feet.
Price for Fiber Optic Runs
# Item Price
130 |Six strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) loose tube $ $3.48 ft.
131 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) loose tube $ $4.16 ft.
132 JEighteen strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) loose tube $ $5.10 ft.
133 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) loose tube $ $5.81 ft.
134 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) loose tube $ $9.07 ft.
135 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) loose tube $ $16.00 ft.
136 |Six strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) indoor/outdoor $ $3.45 ft.
137 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) indoor/outdoor $ $4.59 ft.
138 JEighteen strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) indoor/outdoor $ $6.37 ft.
139 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) indoor/outdoor $ $7.18 ft.
140 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) indoor/outdoor $ $11.54 ft.
141 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) indoor/outdoor $ $20.81 ft.
142 |Six strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $3.48 ft.
143 |Six strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum $ $3.41 ft.
144 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $4.66 ft.
145 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum $ $5.07 ft.
146 JEighteen strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $6.90 ft.
147 JEighteen strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum $ $6.37 ft.
148 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $7.54 ft.
149 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum $ $6.16 ft.
150 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $14.35 ft.
151 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum $ $10.53 ft.
152 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Plenum $ $27.24 ft.
153 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber (62.5/125mm) Non-plenum $ $20.80 ft.
154 |Six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) loose tube $ $3.44 ft.
155 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) loose tube $ $4.08 ft.
156 |Eighteen strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) loose tube $ $4.98 ft.
157 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) loose tube $ $5.64 ft.
158 | Thirty-six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) loose tube $ $6.98 ft.
159 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) loose tube $ $8.76 ft.
160 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) loose tube $ $15.39 ft.
161 |Six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) indoor/outdoor $ $3.45 ft.
162 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) indoor/outdoor $ $4.59 ft.
163 JEighteen strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) indoor/outdoor $ $6.39 ft.
164 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) indoor/outdoor $ $7.18 ft.
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165 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) indoor/outdoor $ $11.54 ft.
166 [Ninety-six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) indoor/outdoor $ $20.81 ft.
167 |Six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Aerial $ $5.52 ft.
168 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Aerial $ $6.15 ft.
169 JEighteen strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Aerial $ $6.83 ft.
170 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Aerial $ $7.01 ft.
171 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Aerial $ $10.16 ft.
172 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Aerial $ $15.67 ft.
173 |Six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Plenum $ $3.48 ft.
174 |Six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Non-plenum $ $3.41 ft.
175 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Plenum $ $4.66 ft.
176 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Non-plenum $ $4.54 ft.
177 JEighteen strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Plenum $ $6.90 ft.
178 JEighteen strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Non-plenum $ $6.37 ft.
179 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Plenum $ $7.54 ft.
180 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Non-plenum $ $6.16 ft.
181 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Plenum $ $9.02 ft.
182 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Non-plenum $ $10.53 ft.
183 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Plenum $ $27.24 ft.
184 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Non-plenum $ $20.80 ft.
185 |Six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Plenum (10 Gigabit) $ $3.82 ft.
186 |Six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Non-plenum (10 Gigabit) $ $3.73 ft.
187 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Plenum (10 Gigabit) $ $5.27 ft.
188 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Non-plenum (10 Gigabit) $ $5.19 ft.
189 JEighteen strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Plenum (10 Gigabit) $ $9.60 ft.
190 JEighteen strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Non-plenum (10 Gigabit) $ $6.43 ft.
191 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Plenum (10 Gigabit) $ $11.22 ft.
192 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Non-plenum (10 Gigabit) $ $8.32 ft.
193 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Plenum (10 Gigabit) $ $17.00 ft.
194 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Non-plenum (10 Gigabit) $ $13.62 ft.
195 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Plenum (10 Gigabit) $ $33.04 ft.
196 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber (50/125mm) Non-plenum (10 Gigabit) $ $27.27 ft.
197 |Six strand Optical Fiber Single Mode loose tube $ $3.30 ft.
198 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber Single Mode loose tube $ $3.85 ft.
199 JEighteen strand Optical Fiber Single Mode loose tube $ $4.63 ft.
200 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber Single Mode loose tube $ $5.17 ft.
201 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber Single Mode loose tube $ $7.78 ft.
202 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber Single Mode loose tube $ $13.35 ft.
203 JOne Hundred & Forty-four strand Optical Fiber Single Mode loose tube $ $24.13 ft.
204 |Six strand Optical Fiber Single Mode indoor/outdoor $ $3.23 ft.
205 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber Single Mode indoor/outdoor $ $3.89 ft.
206 |Eighteen strand Optical Fiber Single Mode indoor/outdoor $ $5.29 ft.
207 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber Single Mode indoor/outdoor $ $6.59 ft.
208 JThirty-six strand Optical Fiber Single Mode indoor/outdoor $ $7.65 ft.
209 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber Single Mode indoor/outdoor $ $9.07 ft.
210 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber Single Mode indoor/outdoor $ $15.26 ft.
211 JOne Hundred & Forty-four strand Optical Fiber Single Mode indoor/outdoor $ $21.42 ft.
212 |Six strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Aerial $ $5.39 ft.
213 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Aerial $ $5.92 ft.
214 JEighteen strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Aerial $ $6.47 ft.
215 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Aerial $ $7.01 ft.
216 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Aerial $ $9.19 ft.
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217 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Aerial $ $13.70 ft.
218 |Six strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Plenum $ $3.23 ft.
219 |Six strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Non-plenum $ $3.13 ft.
220 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Plenum $ $3.91 ft.
221 JTwelve strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Non-plenum $ $3.85 ft.
222 |Eighteen strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Plenum $ $8.00 ft.
223 |Eighteen strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Non-plenum $ $5.22 ft.
224 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Plenum $ $6.35 ft.
225 JTwenty-four strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Non-plenum $ $6.03 ft.
226 |Forty-eight strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Plenum $ $11.04 ft.
227 JForty-eight strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Non-plenum $ $8.55 ft.
228 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Plenum $ $20.64 ft.
229 INinety-six strand Optical Fiber Single Mode Non-plenum $ $15.77 ft.
230 |4-Strand Armored Fiber 50/125 mm Loose Tube $ $3.31 ft.
231 |6-Strand Armored Fiber 50/125 mm Loose Tube $ $3.54 ft.
232 |12-Strand Armored Fiber 50/125 mm Loose Tube $ $4.20 ft.
233 |24-Strand Armored Fiber 50/125 mm Loose Tube $ $5.76 ft.
234 |36-Strand Armored Fiber 50/125 mm Loose Tube $ $7.31 ft.
235 |4-Strand Armored Fiber 62.5/125 mm Loose Tube $ $3.37 ft.
236 |6-Strand Armored Fiber 62.5/125 mm Loose Tube $ $3.60 ft.
237 |12-Strand Armored Fiber 62.5/125 mm Loose Tube $ $4.28 ft.
238 |24-Strand Armored Fiber 62.5/125 mm Loose Tube $ $5.92 ft.
239 |36-Strand Armored Fiber 62.5/125 mm Loose Tube $ $8.74 ft.
240 |6-Strand Armored Fiber Single Mode $ $3.19 ft.
241 112-Strand Armored Fiber Single Mode $ $3.74 ft.
242 J24-Strand Armored Fiber Single Mode $ $4.82 ft.
243 148-Strand Armored Fiber Single Mode $ $7.01 ft.
244 1120-Strand Armored Fiber Single Mode $ $14.08 ft.

Installed including all necessary fasteners, testing and fire stopping.

Price for Patch Cords

# Item Price
245 JCategory 5e patch cable (3' foot) $ $2.61 ea.
246 |Category 5e patch cable (6' foot) $ $3.17 ea.
247 |Category 5e patch cable (12' foot) $ $4.65 ea.
248 |Category 5e patch cable (25' foot) $ $6.69 ea.
249 |Category 6 patch cable (3' foot) $ $3.67 ea.
250 |Category 6 patch cable (6' foot) $ $4.65 ea.
251 |Category 6 patch cable (12' foot) $ $6.28 ea.
252 JCategory 6 patch cable (25' foot) $ $8.31 ea.
253 |Optical Fiber Jumper SM ST/ST (1 meter) $ $11.26 ea.
254 JOptical Fiber Jumper SM ST/ST (3 meter) $ $13.05 ea.
255 |Optical Fiber Jumper SM ST/ST (10 meter) $ $19.02 ea.
256 |Optical Fiber Jumper SM SC/SC (1 meter) $ $11.26 ea.
257 |Optical Fiber Jumper SM SC/SC (3 meter) $ $13.05 ea.
258 |Optical Fiber Jumper SM SC/SC (10 meter) $ $19.02 ea.
259 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper ST/ST 62.5/125mm (1 meter) $ $18.43 ea.
260 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper ST/ST 62.5/125mm (2 meter) $ $19.90 ea.
261 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper ST/ST 62.5/125mm (3 meter) $ $21.46 ea.
262 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper ST/SC 62.5/125mm (1 meter) $ $18.43 ea.
263 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper ST/SC 62.5/125mm (2 meter) $ $19.90 ea.
264 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper ST/SC 62.5/125mm (3 meter) $ $21.46 ea.
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265 JOptical Fiber Duplex Jumper SC/SC 62.5/125mm (1 meter) $ $18.43 ea.
266 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SC/SC 62.5/125mm (2 meter) $ $19.90 ea.
267 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SC/SC 62.5/125mm (3 meter) $ $21.46 ea.
268 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper ST/ST 50/125mm (1 meter) $ $18.92 ea.
269 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper ST/ST 50/125mm (2 meter) $ $20.65 ea.
270 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper ST/ST 50/125mm (3 meter) $ $22.52 ea.
271 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper ST/SC 50/125mm (1 meter) $ $18.92 ea.
272 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper ST/SC 50/125mm (2 meter) $ $20.65 ea.
273 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper ST/SC 50/125mm (3 meter) $ $22.52 ea.
274 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SC/SC 50/125mm (1 meter) $ $18.92 ea.
275 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SC/SC 50/125mm (2 meter) $ $20.65 ea.
276 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SC/SC 50/125mm (3 meter) $ $22.52 ea.
277 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SFF/SC 62.5/125mm (1 meter) $ $22.36 ea.
278 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SFF/SC 62.5/125mm (2 meter) $ $23.91 ea.
279 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SFF/SC 62.5/125mm (3 meter) $ $25.38 ea.
280 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SFF/ST 62.5/125mm (1 meter) $ $22.36 ea.
281 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SFF/ST 62.5/125mm (2 meter) $ $23.91 ea.
282 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SFF/ST 62.5/125mm (3 meter) $ $25.39 ea.
283 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SFF/SFF 62.5/125mm (1 meter) $ $26.35 ea.
284 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SFF/SFF 62.5/125mm (2 meter) $ $27.91 ea.
285 |Optical Fiber Duplex Jumper SFF/SFF 62.5/125mm (3 meter) $ $29.29 ea.
Not-installed - delivered to owner.
Price for Miscellaneous Items
# Item Price

286 |Category 5e Patch Panel 12 port modular to 110 $ $106.70 ea.
287 |Category 5e Patch Panel 16 port modular to 110 $ $140.89 ea.
288 |Category 5e Patch Panel 24 port modular to 110 $ $140.89 ea.
289 |Category 5e Patch Panel 32 port modular to 110 $ $275.59 ea.
290 |Category 5e Patch Panel 48 port modular to 110 $ $275.59 ea.
291 |Category 5e Patch Panel 96 port modular to 110 $ $514.96 ea.
292 |Category 6 Patch Panel 12 port modular to 110 $ $136.88 ea.
293 |Category 6 Patch Panel 16 port modular to 110 $ $206.40 ea.
294 |Category 6 Patch Panel 24 port modular to 110 $ $206.40 ea.
295 |Category 6 Patch Panel 32 port modular to 110 $ $400.66 ea.
296 |Category 6 Patch Panel 48 port modular to 110 $ $400.66 ea.
297 |Category 6 Patch Panel 96 port modular to 110 $ $732.23 ea.
298 |Horizontal Wire Management Panel $ $48.74 ea.
299 |Vertical Wire Management $ $218.27 ea.
300 JWall Mounted Equipment Rack (35" x 19" x 18") $ $251.15 ea.
301 Wall Mounted Equipment Rack (21" x 19" x 18") $ $240.05 ea.
302 |Floor Mounted Equipment Rack (7' x 19") 6" channel w/ Vertical Management $ $481.19 ea.
303 |Floor Mounted Equipment Rack (7' x 19") 4" channel w/ Vertical Management $ $269.06 ea.
304 |Freestanding Enclosed Cabinet (84" x 29" x 26") $ $2,024.00 ea.
305 [Wall Mounted Enclosed Cabinet (48" x 24" x 24") $ $1,072.38 ea.
306 |Small Wall Mounted Enclosed Cabinet (24" x 24" x 24") $ $808.04 ea.
307 [Narrow Wall Mounted Enclosed Cabinet (24" x 28" x 10") $ $692.69 ea.
308 |Backboard ~ 4'x 8'x %" $ $320.14 ea.
309 |Backboard 4'x 4" x Y $ $173.26 ea.
310 |Rack - Anti-Static Pad $ $283.04 ea.
311 |Rack - Isolation Pad $ $62.33 ea.
312 |Surface Mounted Box $ $7.42 ea.
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313 |100-Pair 110 Wiring Block with legs $ $36.44 ea.
314 |300-Pair 110 Wiring Block with legs $ $92.17 ea.
315 |100-Pair Tower Systems $ $141.26 ea.
316 |300-Pair Tower Systems $ $348.05 ea.
317 |Block Connector four Pair (C-4 clips) $ $1.46 ea.
318 |Block Connector five Pair (C-5 clips) $ $1.56 ea.
319 |66 Block with stand off bracket $ $21.80 ea.
320 |Copper Splice Enclosure 4" x 22" $ $197.74 ea.
321 |Copper Splice Enclosure 8.5" x 22.5" $ $388.18 ea.
322 |Copper Splice Enclosure 8" x 36" $ $827.62 ea.
323 |Copper Splice (one Pair) $ $4.01 ea.
324 |Building Entrance Protector for Voice (2-Pair) with Solid State Modules $ $125.16 ea.
325 |Building Entrance Protector for Voice (6-Pair) with Solid State Modules $ $143.28 ea.
326 |Building Entrance Protector for Voice (12-Pair) with Solid State Modules $ $207.19 ea.
327 |Building Entrance Protector for Voice (25-Pair) with Solid State Modules $ $322.34 ea.
328 |Building Entrance Protector for Voice (50-Pair) with Solid State Modules $ $621.68 ea.
329 |Building Entrance Protector for Voice (100-Pair) with Solid State Modules $ $1,036.48 ea.
330 |Building Entrance Protector (2-Pair) with Gas Tube Modules $ $122.39 ea.
331 |Building Entrance Protector for Voice (6-Pair) with Gas Tube Modules $ $134.15 ea.
332 |Building Entrance Protector for Voice (12-Pair) with Gas Tube Modules $ $267.66 ea.
333 |Building Entrance Protector for Voice (25-Pair) with Gas Tube Modules $ $356.13 ea.
334 |Building Entrance Protector for Voice (50-Pair) with Gas Tube Modules $ $548.24 ea.
335 |Building Entrance Protector for Voice (100-Pair) with Gas Tube Modules $ $889.61 ea.
336 |Building Entrance Protector for Data (4-Pair) with Solid State Modules $ $119.29 ea.
337 |Building Entrance Protector for Data (8-Pair) with Solid State Modules $ $146.18 ea.
338 |Building Entrance Protector for Data (12Pair) with Solid State Modules $ $197.65 ea.
339 |Building Entrance Protector for Data (32-Pair) with Solid State Modules $ $563.14 ea.
340 |Fiber Splice Closure 4.5" x 18" $ $325.53 ea.
341 |Fiber Splice Closure 6.6" x 22" $ $491.97 ea.
342 |Fiber Splice Closure 8.5" x 28" $ $812.45 ea.
343 [Wall Fiber Interconnect / Splice Cabinet 72 -144 Port Loaded $ $1,137.52 ea.
344 |Splice Tray $ $105.02 ea.
345 |Wall Mount Splice Cabinet $ $394.06 ea.
346 |Rack Mount Splice Cabinet $ $394.06 ea.
347 |Fusion Splice $ $9.35 ea.
348 |Mechanical Splice $ $25.45 ea.
349 [Fusion Splice Protector $ $9.35 ea.
350 |Re-enterable Compound (small) $ $72.50 ea.
351 |Re-enterable Compound (large) $ $126.89 ea.
352 |Buffer Tube Fan-out Kits $ $51.62 ea.
353 |Optical Fiber ST Connector $ $12.76 ea.
354 |Optical Fiber SC Connector $ $14.05 ea.
355 |Optical Fiber SFF Connector $ $26.71 ea.
356 |Fiber Interconnect Cabinet 12-Port Loaded - 1 RU $ $277.62 ea.
357 |Fiber Interconnect Cabinet 18-Port Loaded - 1 RU $ $298.84 ea.
358 |Fiber Interconnect Cabinet 24-Port Loaded - 1 RU $ $326.47 ea.
359 |Fiber Interconnect Cabinet 36-Port Loaded - 2 RU $ $394.06 ea.
360 |Fiber Interconnect Cabinet 48-96-Port Loaded - 2 RU $ $696.38 ea.
361 |Fiber Interconnect Cabinet 72-144-Port Loaded - 4 RU $ $1,137.52 ea.
362 |Fiber Couplers $ $16.88 ea.
363 [Concrete Pole - 16 foot $ $1,830.00 ea.

Installed with all necessary fire stopping, fittings and fastener
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Price for Coaxial Runs

# Item Price
364 |Run of RG-11 Plenum Coax $ $4.09 ft.
365 JRun of RG-11 Non-Plenum Coax (In Conduit) $ $1.92 ft.
366 JRun of RG-6 Plenum Coax $ $1.89 ft.
367 JRun of RG-6 Non-Plenum Coax (In Conduit) $ $0.16 ft.
368 |Run of RG-59 Plenum Coax $ $1.84 ft.
369 JRun of RG-59 Non-Plenum Coax (In Conduit) $ $0.51 ft.
370 JRun of Flooded RG-11 Coax (In Conduit) $ $2.22 ft.
371 JRun of RG-6/18-2 CAMERA CABLE $2.50 ft.
Includes installation, termination and testing per the specifications. Includes cable
fire stopping and cable support hangers and electronic documentation.

Price for Miscellaneous Coaxial Items

# Item Price
372 [Male “F” Connector, Crimp-On, RG-59 Series $ $6.04 ea.
373 |Male “F” Connector, Crimp-On, RG-6 Series $ $6.04 ea.
374 [Male “F” Connector, Crimp-On, RG-11 Series $ $9.61 ea.
375 |Male BNC Connector, Crimp-On, three-piece, RG-59 Series $ $9.28 ea.
376 |Coaxial Adapter, “F” Inline Splice, Female to Female $ $3.53 ea.
377 |Coaxial Adapter, “F” Inline Splice, Female to Female with Nut and Washer $ $3.53 ea.
378 |Coaxial “F” Terminator $ $3.94 ea.
379 |Coaxial BNC Adapter, Female to Female Splice $ $4.16 ea.
380 |Coaxial BNC Adapter, BNC “T” Female $ $4.87 ea.
381 |Coaxial BNC Terminator $ $4.76 ea.
382 |wall Plate, with Female to Female “F” Connector $ $5.11 ea.
383 |Passive Two-Way Splitter, 5-750 MHz $ $3.33 ea.
384 |Passive Three-Way Splitter, 5-750 MHz $ $4.38 ea.
385 |Passive Four-Way Splitter, 5-750 MHz $ $4.79 ea.
386 |Passive Eight-Way Splitter, 5-750 MHz $ $6.95 ea.
387 |Coaxial protector $ $61.77 ea.
388 |Indoor Directional Tap, Four Output, 5-750 MHz $ $5.61 ea.
389 |Indoor Directional Tap, Eight Output, 5-750 MHz $ $14.95 ea.
390 |Indoor Directional Tap, Twelve Output, 5-750 MHz $ $20.56 ea.
391 |Female-to-Male Fixed Attenuator, 5 to 750 MHz $ $9.14 ea.
Includes installation.

Price for Grounding System

# Item Price
392 |#6 AWG stranded copper wire cable $ $2.21 ft.
393 |Ground Termination $ $7.42 ea.
394 |Ground Bus Bar $ $72.19 ea.
395 [Main Ground Bus Bar $ $82.30 ea.
Installed including all necessary fittings.

Price for Conduit Pathways

# Item Price
396 |3/4" EMT conduit $ $3.97 ft.
397 |1" EMT conduit $ $5.19 ft.
398 |2" EMT conduit $ $10.07 ft.
399 |4" EMT conduit $ $24.40 ft.
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400 |JEMT Pull Box 12" x 12" x 12" $ $183.00 ea.
401 |JEMT Pull Box 24" x 24" x 6" $ $219.60 ea.
403 |3/4" GRS conduit $ $6.41 ft.
404 |1" GRS conduit $ $8.54 ft.
405 |2" GRS conduit $ $17.08 ft.
406 |4" GRS conduit $ $47.58 ft.
407 |3/4" IMC conduit $ $5.19 ft.
408 |1" IMC conduit $ $6.71 ft.
409 |2" IMC conduit $ $16.78 ft.
410 |4" IMC conduit $ $53.07 ft.
411 |2" Schedule 40 PVC conduit & warning tape with 24" of cover $ $13.36 ft.
412 4" Schedule 40 PVC conduit & warning tape with 24" of cover $ $20.44 ft.
413 |2" Sleeve $ $63.16 ea.
414 |4" Sleeve $ $115.81 ea.
415 |2" Conduit Core Drill $ $244.00 ea.
416 |3" Conduit Core Drill $ $244.00 ea.
417 |4" Conduit Core Dirill $ $274.50 ea.
418 2" Conduit Core Drill with X-ray $ $671.00 ea.
419 |3" Conduit Core Drill with X-ray $ $671.00 ea.
420 4" Conduit Core Drill with X-ray $ $701.50 ea.
421 |Category 5 cable support hangers $ $7.00 ea.
422 ]10' Tele-data Power Pole $ $242.16 ea.
423 |12' Tele-data Power Pole $ $284.74 ea.
424 |15' Tele-data Power Pole $ $378.24 ea.
425 [Metallic Surface Raceway (Sized for 4 Category 5e Cables) $ $4.00 ft.
426 |Metallic Surface Raceway (Sized for 4 Category 6 Cables) $ $4.49 ft.
427 INon-Metallic Surface Raceway 1.5" $ $3.67 ft.
428 |Hand hole (approximately 2' x 3' x 18" open bottom with bolt down lid) $ $500.20 ea.
429 [Hand hole (approximately 42" x 28" x 24" open bottom with bolt down lid) $ $622.20 ea.
430 [Hand hole (approximately 4' x 2.5' x 3' open bottom with bolt down lid) $ $2,061.80 ea.
431 [Hand hole (approximately 4' x 3' x 2' open bottom with bolt down lid) $ $2,257.00 ea.
432 |50 # bag of gravel $ $140.30 ea.
433 |Plenum Inner duct 1" $ $5.34 ft.
434 INon-plenum Inner duct 1" $ $3.54 ft.
435 |Outside Plant Inner duct 1" $ $3.11 ft.
436 |Plenum Inner duct 1-1/4" $ $5.54 ft.
437 INon-plenum Inner duct 1-1/4" $ $3.70 ft.
438 |Outside Plant Inner duct 1-1/4" $ $3.42 ft.
439 |3 x 3 cell Flexible Engineered Fabric Conduit $ $16.47 ft.
440 JRod Conduit and install mule tape $ $2.56 ft.
441 |12" Standard Cable Tray $ $26.54 ft.
442 12" Runway Cable Tray $ $20.13 ft.
443 |12" Flex tray Cable Tray $ $19.34 ft.
444 |18" Standard Cable Tray $ $34.53 ft.
445 118" Runway Cable Tray $ $22.51 ft.
446 |18" Flex tray Cable Tray $ $21.53 ft.
Installed including all necessary fittings, fasteners, fire stopping, and junction
boxes with pull strings installed.
Price for Installation, Training and Owner Assistance

# Item Price

447 |Rate per hour - labor only $ $45.75 hr.
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448 Overtime rate per hour - labor only $ $68.63 hr.
449 |Demolition of Existing Cabling $ $45.75 hr.
Two Hours Minimum. Office Hours Only (Monday- Friday 8:00 A.M. to 5:00 P.M.)
ITEMS BELOW ARE OPTIONAL
Price for Directional Drilling (Optional)

# Item Price
450 |2" Polyduct (500’ or less) $ $36.60 ft.
451 |4" Polyduct (500 or less) $ $43.92 ft.
452 14" Multiduct with 3 inner ducts (500 or less) $ $51.24 ft.
453 |2" Polyduct (more than 500') $ $34.16 ft.
454 14" Polyduct (more than 500') $ $41.48 ft.
455 14" Multiduct with 3 inner ducts (more than 500') $ $47.58 ft.
Includes installation and mapping per the specifications.

Price for Air Blown Optical Fiber Cable (Optional)

# Item Price
456 |19 tube Outside plant tube cable $ No Bid  ft.
457 |7 tube Outside plant tube cable $ No Bid  ft.
458 14 tube Outside plant tube cable $ No Bid  ft.
459 ]2 tube Outside plant tube cable $ No Bid  ft.
460 |19 tube Riser rated tube cable $ No Bid  ft.
461 |7 tube riser rated tube cable $ No Bid  ft.
462 |3 tube riser rated tube cable $ No Bid  ft.
463 ]2 tube riser rated tube cable $ No Bid  ft.
464 |Single tube riser rated tube cable $ No Bid  ft.
465 |7 tube plenum rated tube cable $ No Bid  ft.
466 |3 tube plenum rated tube cable $ No Bid  ft.
467 |2 tube plenum rated tube cable $ No Bid  ft.
468 |Single tube plenum rated tube cable $ No Bid  ft.
469 |18 strand MM 62.5/125micron fiber bundle $ No Bid  ft.
470 |12 strand MM 62.5/125 micron fiber bundle $ No Bid  ft.
471 |6 strand MM 62.5/125 micron fiber bundle $ No Bid  ft.
472 |2 strand MM 62.5/125 micron fiber bundle $ No Bid  ft.
473 |18 strand MM 50/125micron fiber bundle $ No Bid  ft.
474 |12 strand MM 50/125 micron fiber bundle $ No Bid  ft.
475 |6 strand MM 50/125 micron fiber bundle $ No Bid  ft.
476 |2 strand MM 50/125 micron fiber bundle $ No Bid  ft.
477 |18 strand SM 8.3/125 micron fiber bundle $ No Bid  ft.
478 |12 strand SM 8.3/125 micron fiber bundle $ No Bid  ft.
479 |6 strand SM 8.3/125 micron fiber bundle $ No Bid  ft.
480 ]2 strand SM 8.3/125 micron fiber bundle $ No Bid  ft.
481 |Tube routing panel (PVC) 16"x14"x7" $ No Bid  ea.
482 | Tube routing panel (PVC) 24"x24"x8" $ No Bid  ea.
483 | Tube routing panel (PVC) 24"x36"x10" $ No Bid ea.
484 | Tube routing panel (metal) 18"x18"x6" $ No Bid  ea.
485 | Tube routing panel (metal) 24"x24"x8" $ No Bid ea.
Includes installation, termination and testing per the specifications. Includes cable
fire stopping and cable support hangers and electronic documentation.

Price for Electrical Power Work (Optional)
# | Item Price
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486]20 Amp, 120 VAC, duplex receptacle circuit. $ $732.00 ea.
487|Additional 20 Amp, 120 VAC, duplex receptacle on existing circuit. $ $640.50 ea.
48820 Amp, 240 VAC, receptacle circuit. $ $780.80 ea.
Includes installation, conduit, conductors, receptacle, breaker, box and cover per the specifications.

Price for Wireless LAN (Optional)

# Item Price

489 | Access Points (2.4-GHz) $ $580.00 ea.
490 | Access Points (5-GHz) $ $580.00 ea.
491 | Access Points (2.4 & 5-GHz) Dual Band $ $580.00 ea.
492 [Wireless Bridge $ $91.00 ea.
493 JPCMCIA - NIC Card $ $36.00 ea.
494 |PCI - NIC Card $ $34.00 ea.
495 IMini-PCI - NIC Card $ $28.00 ea.
496 |Power Injector $ $143.00 ea.
497 |Diversity omni POS dipoles with nhominal gain of 2.2dbi $ $216.00 ea.
498 |Diversity omni indoor ceiling mount antenna with nominal gain of 2.2 dbi. $ $110.00 ea.
499 IDiversity patch indoor/outdoor wall mount antenna with nominal gain of 6dbi $ $55.00 ea.
500 |Diversity omni pillar mount indoor antenna with nominal gain of 5.2dbi $ $182.00 ea.
501 JOmni ceiling mount indoor antenna with nominal gain of 5.2dbi $ $137.00 ea.
502 JOmni-directional single dipole antenna with nominal gain of. 2.2 dbi $ $21.00 ea.
503 JPatch wall mount indoor/outdoor antenna with nominal gain of 8.5dbi $ $244.00 ea.
504 |Directional wall mount indoor/outdoor patch antenna with nominal gain of 5.2dbi $ $199.00 ea.
505 JOmni mast mount outdoor high gain antenna with nominal gain of 12dbi $ $165.00 ea.
506 |Yagi high gain outdoor directional antenna with nominal gain of 13.5dbi $ $350.00 ea.
507 JParabolic very high gain dish outdoor antenna with nominal gain of 21dbi $ $950.00 ea.
508 JInterconnect Cable $ $40.00 ea.
509 ]|50' Low Loss Cable $ $136.92 ea.
510 J100' Low Loss Cable $ $273.80 ea.
511 |150' Low Loss Cable $ $410.70 ea.
512 |50" Ultra Low Loss Cable $ $178.68 ea.
513 J100' Ultra Low Loss Cable $ $357.35 ea.
514 ]150' Ultra Low Loss Cable $ $536.03 ea.
515 |50' STD Cable $ $191.69 ea.
516 ]100' STD Cable $ $383.32 ea.
517 |150' STD Cable $ $574.99 ea.
518 |Lightning Arrestors $ $55.00 ea.
Includes installation, termination, software and testing per the specifications. Includes cable
fire stopping and cable support hangers and electronic documentation.

Price for Integrated Loudspeaker Paging System (Optional)

# Item Price

519|Page Control Interface 1 zone $ $294.14 ea.

520)Page Control Interface 3 zone $ $440.24 ea.

521]Page Control Interface 6 zone $ $570.72 ea.

522|Page Control Interface 24 zone extension module $ $1,325.81 ea.

523|Lay-in Speaker t-bar ceiling unit $ $91.67 ea.

524]Speaker 8" ceiling unit $ $75.79 ea.

525]Speaker 4" ceiling unit $ $72.26 ea.

526]Surface Speaker unit. $ $92.46 ea.

527]Horn unit $ $147.84 ea.

528]24v power supply $ $79.61 ea.

Includes installation, termination, documentation and testing per the specifications.
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